


Has it ever dawned on you that nothing has ever
dawned on God? He knew before the world
began that His people would face hardship, so He
gave us His Word. The Book of Ephesians is a
survival manual—it equips believers to thrive in a
world that hates the message of Jesus Christ.
Paul the Apostle writes to encourage believers to
live well—we've been lifted from the graveyard of
sin and called to shout the gospel into the
darkened world. 

Pastor and author J.D. Greear walks through the
powerful words of Paul. In 9 sessions, J.D. digs into
the text of Ephesians verse-by-verse and
challenges believers to live out the gospel. If the
people of your city, of your school, of your family
are going to hear the gospel, it's going to be from
your mouth. Encounter Ephesians, and get swept
up into the story of Jesus.



On the following pages you will find all of the
information needed to go through the Ephesians
Life Group Material. There are corresponding
videos that can be accessed through our
"RightNow Media" account with the church. If you
don't have an account, go to
rightnowmedia.org/Account/Invite/BrackenRidge
BaptistChurch. After creating an account search
"The Book Of Ephesians" to access the 9 weeks.

If you are unable for some reason to access the
material through these different means, please
simply email office@brbc.org.au or call 07 3261
5045.

Accessing The Material

http://rightnowmedia.org/Account/Invite/BrackenRidgeBaptistChurch
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